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DYNAMIC MICROPHONE SUPPORT 
APPARATUS 

BACKGROUND 

[0001] 1. Field 
[0002] This disclosure generally relates to the ?eld of sup 
port structures. More particularly, the disclosure relates to an 
apparatus that supports a microphone. 
[0003] 2. General Background 
[0004] A microphone is typically supported by a static 
microphone support apparatus. In other Words, a user of the 
microphone normally places the microphone on a stand that is 
statically positioned in a single location. When the user Would 
like to talk or sing into the microphone, the user generally has 
to approach the microphone stand. The user can then talk or 
sing directly into the microphone, but With a limited amount 
of movement so that the user stays Within close proximity to 
the microphone. The microphone is typically too heavy and 
cumbersome to be picked up and moved around With the 
microphone. 
[0005] During a performance, the quality of the audio that 
is outputted form the microphone is normally affected by the 
performer moving With respect to the stationary microphone. 
Even When moving Within close proximity to the micro 
phone, the performer still has to move his or her head With 
respect to the microphone. Such movement may lead to 
inconsistent quality in the audio that is outputted from the 
microphone. 
[0006] The only current alternative for a user that Would 
like unrestricted movement is to remove the microphone from 
the stand and move about With the microphone. Such an 
alternative may present a number of safety haZards. For 
example, if the microphone is connected via cable, the user 
may trip over the cable While moving about With the micro 
phone. A performer on stage at a concert may have a dance 
routine in addition to a singing routine, and the presence of 
the cable may lead to the performer being tangled by the cable 
and tripping during the performance. 
[0007] Although some microphones are Wireless, the stand 
by itself occupies a portion of the stage and can present an 
additional safety haZard While the performer is performing a 
dance routine. This problem becomes even more signi?cant 
When there are multiple performers that each have stands 
Which are left unattended. 

SUMMARY 

[0008] In one aspect of the disclosure, an apparatus is pro 
vided. The apparatus has a base that has a concave-shaped 
bottom portion that is positional on a surface. Further, the 
apparatus has a compartment in the base that stores an adhe 
sive material. In addition, the apparatus has a base cover that 
is positioned over the base and covers the compartment such 
that Weight of a user positioned on the base cover applied in a 
direction causes the base to tilt With respect to the surface in 
the direction. The apparatus also has a rod member having a 
?rst end, a second end, and a middle portion. The ?rst end is 
positioned through an opening in the base cover into the 
adhesive material in the compartment such that the rod mem 
ber is immovable With respect to the base. Further, the second 
end is con?gured to receive a microphone apparatus. In addi 
tion, the middle portion is con?gured to connect the ?rst end 
and the second end. 
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[0009] In another aspect of the disclosure, an apparatus is 
provided. The apparatus has a base having a concave-shaped 
bottom portion that is positional on a surface. Further, the 
apparatus has a compartment in the base that stores an adhe 
sive material. In addition, the apparatus has a base cover that 
is positioned over the base and covers the compartment such 
that Weight of a user positioned on the base cover applied in a 
direction causes the base to tilt With respect to the surface in 
the direction. The apparatus also has a rod member that has a 
?rst end, a second end, and a middle portion. The ?rst end is 
positioned through an opening in the base cover into the 
adhesive material in the compartment such that the rod mem 
ber is immovable With respect to the base. Further, the second 
end is con?gured to receive a microphone apparatus. In addi 
tion, the middle portion is con?gured to connect the ?rst end 
and the second end such that a force applied to the rod mem 
ber in a direction by a user positioned on the base cover causes 
the base to tilt With respect to the surface in the direction. 
[0010] In yet another aspect of the disclosure, an apparatus 
is provided. The apparatus has a base having a concave 
shaped bottom portion that is positional on a surface. Further, 
the apparatus has a compartment in the base that stores a 
compound to stabiliZe the Weight of a user. In addition, the 
apparatus has a base cover that is positioned over the base. 
The apparatus also has a rod member having a ?rst end, a 
second end, and a middle portion. The ?rst end is connected 
to the base cover such that the rod member is immovable With 
respect to the base. Further, the second end is con?gured to 
receive a microphone apparatus. In addition, the middle por 
tion is con?gured to connect the ?rst end and the second end 
such that a force applied to the rod member in a direction by 
the user positioned on the base cover causes the compound to 
shift in the direction, Which causes the base to tilt With respect 
to the surface in the direction. 
[0011] In another aspect of the disclosure, a kit is provided. 
The kit includes a microphone stand apparatus. The micro 
phone stand apparatus has (i) a base having a concave-shaped 
bottom portion that is positional on a surface, (ii) a compart 
ment in the base that stores a compound to stabiliZe the Weight 
of a user, (iii) a base cover that is positioned over the base, and 
(iv) a rod member having a ?rst end, a second end, and a 
middle portion, the ?rst end being connected to the base cover 
such that the rod member is immovable With respect to the 
base, the second end is con?gured to receive a microphone 
apparatus, and the middle portion is con?gured to connect the 
?rst end and the second end such that a force applied to the rod 
member in a direction by the user positioned on the base cover 
causes the compound to shift in the direction, Which causes 
the base to tilt With respect to the surface in the direction. The 
kit also includes a microphone that is operably connected to 
the second end. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

[0012] The above-mentioned features of the present disclo 
sure Will become more apparent With reference to the folloW 
ing description taken in conjunction With the accompanying 
draWings Wherein like reference numerals denote like ele 
ments and in Which: 
[0013] FIGS. 1A and 1B illustrate implementations of a 
dynamic microphone support apparatus. 
[0014] FIG. 1A illustrates the dynamic microphone support 
apparatus that may be utiliZed in conjunction With a micro 
phone, a microphone receptacle, and a microphone connec 
tor. 



US 2009/0196451 A1 

[0015] FIG. 1B illustrates the dynamic microphone support 
apparatus that may be utilized in conjunction With a micro 
phone and a microphone receptacle Without the microphone 
connector shoWn in FIG. 1A. 
[0016] FIG. 2 illustrates an assembly of the support appa 
ratus from FIG. 1A connected to the microphone connector, 
the microphone receptacle, and the microphone. 
[0017] FIGS. 3A-3C illustrate the assembly shoWn in FIG. 
2 as utiliZed by a performer 302. 
[0018] FIG. 3A illustrates the performer standing on the 
base cover in a neutral balanced position. 
[0019] FIG. 3B illustrates a leftward tilt from the perspec 
tive of the performer. 
[0020] FIG. 3C illustrates a rightward tilt from the perspec 
tive of the performer. 
[0021] FIGS. 4A-4D illustrate various con?gurations for 
operably connecting the rod member to the base cover. 
[0022] FIG. 4A illustrates an internal vieW of the assembly 
shoWn in FIG. 2. 
[0023] FIG. 4B illustrates an internal vieW of an alternative 
embodiment of the assembly shoWn in FIG. 2. 
[0024] FIG. 4C illustrates an internal vieW of another alter 
native embodiment of the assembly shoWn in FIG. 2. 
[0025] FIG. 4D illustrates an internal vieW of yet another 
alternative embodiment of the assembly shoWn in FIG. 4C. 
[0026] FIGS. 5A-5D illustrate various con?gurations for 
operably connecting the base cover to the base. 
[0027] In particular, FIG. 5A illustrates the base cover hav 
ing a doWnWardly extending recessed portion, Which may be 
threaded. 
[0028] FIG. 5B illustrates the base cover having a doWn 
Wardly extending portion, Which may be threaded. 
[0029] FIG. 5C illustrates the base cover having a plurality 
of holes and the base having an inner Wall portion With cor 
responding holes. 
[0030] FIG. 5D illustrates the base cover having a plurality 
of holes and the top of the base having corresponding holes. 
[0031] FIGS. 6A and 6B illustrate alternative con?gura 
tions for ?lling and removing the compound from the com 
partment in the base. 
[0032] FIG. 6A illustrates an opening in the base cover in 
Which the compound may be placed Within the compartment 
or removed from the compartment of the base. 
[0033] FIG. 6B illustrates an opening in the base in Which 
the compound may be placed Within the compartment or 
removed from the compartment of the base. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

[0034] A dynamic microphone support apparatus is pro 
vided. The dynamic microphone support apparatus alloWs a 
user to move a microphone support, e.g., a microphone stand, 
in conjunction With talking or singing into a microphone. 
Further, the microphone stand can be moved seamlessly in a 
fashion that is not dif?cult for a large number of users of 
varying ages and physical strengths. In addition, the dynamic 
microphone support apparatus eliminates the safety haZards 
that are seen With a static microphone support apparatus. 
[0035] FIGS. 1A and 1B illustrate implementations of a 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100. In particular, 
FIG. 1A illustrates the dynamic microphone support appara 
tus 100 that may be utiliZed in conjunction With a microphone 
114, a microphone receptacle 116, and a microphone connec 
tor 112. The dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 
includes a base 102 that has a concave-shapedbottom portion. 
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In one embodiment, the bottom portion is entirely concave. In 
another embodiment, the bottom portion may be partially 
concave such that another part of the bottom portion is ?at. 
For example, the bottom portion may have a ?at portion that 
then concaves upWard so that there is extra stability. 

[0036] Further, in one embodiment, the concave-shaped 
bottom portion curves upWard to the top portion of the base so 
that the base 102 is entirely concave. In another embodiment, 
the concave-shaped bottom portion curves upWard to a cer 
tain point Where the base 102 then extends vertically upWard. 
Accordingly, the base 102 having the concave-shaped bottom 
portion does not necessitate a concave shape for the entirety 
ofthe base 102. 
[0037] The concave-shaped bottom portion of the base 102 
may be positioned on a surface 104. For example, the con 
cave-shaped bottom portion may be positioned on a stage 
Where a performer intends to sing or speak With the micro 
phone 114. 
[0038] The base 102 also has a compartment that stores a 
compound. An example of the compound is an adhesive mate 
rial such as cement or glue. Various other compounds such as 
Water, sand, etc., may be utiliZed. 
[0039] A base cover 106 is operably connected to the base 
102 to cover the compartment. The base cover 106 is made 
from a material and is of a thickness that make the base cover 
106 durable enough to Withstand a large doWnWard force. For 
example, When the base cover 106 is operably connected to 
the base 102, an adult is be able to stand on top of the cover 
106 Without the base cover 106 collapsing, bending, etc. The 
base cover 106 remains intact before, during, and after an 
adult stands on top of the cover 106. Accordingly, the base 
cover 106 is intended to Withstand a load exerted on it from a 
single individual that may be a child or adult of varying siZes 
and Weights. In alternative embodiment, the circumference of 
the base 102 and the circumference base cover 106 is sub 
stantially increased from that illustrated in FIG. 1A to With 
stand the load of multiple users at one time. 

[0040] When a user stands in a balanced position on the 
assembled base 102 and base cover 106, the assembled base 
102 and base cover 106 remain stationary. In one embodi 
ment, the angle of the curve toWards the bottom of the con 
cave- shaped bottom portion of the base 1 02 is suf?ciently less 
than the angle of the curve toWards the top of the base 102 to 
distribute the Weight of the user effectively. As an example, 
the angle of the bottom of the concave-shaped bottom portion 
of the base 102 relative to the surface 104 may begin at an 
angle of Zero degrees and slightly increase to an angle in the 
range of one degree to ?fteen degrees along the bottom of the 
concave-shaped bottom portion of the base 102. As the curve 
approaches the top portion of the base 102, the angle may 
begin at an angle in the range of sixty degrees to eighty ?ve 
degrees and then end at an angle of ninety degrees. These 
ranges are provided merely as examples. One of ordinary skill 
in the art Will recogniZe that angles slightly outside of these 
ranges may also be suf?cient for effective Weight distribution. 
[0041] If a user shifts his or her Weight in a particular 
direction, the assembled base 102 and base cover 106 tilt in 
that direction. In one embodiment, the concave shape of the 
bottom portion of the base alloWs for the assembled base 102 
and base cover 106 to tilt in the direction. For example, if a 
user places his or her feet on the base cover 106 and applies 
equal pressure With both feet, the assembled base 102 and 
base cover 106 remain stationary. HoWever, if the user applies 
more pressure With his or her right foot than left foot, the 
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assembled base 102 and base cover 106 tilt towards the right. 
Conversely, if the user applies more pressure With his or her 
left foot than right foot, the assembled base 102 and base 
cover 106 tilt towards the left. 

[0042] In one embodiment, the range of movement of the 
assembled base 102 andbase cover 106 is restricted so that the 
angle of the tilt is not too large to alloW the assembled base 
102 and base cover 106 to topple over. The restricted range of 
movement is helpful in providing safety to a user of the 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100. In one embodi 
ment, the angle of the curve toWards the bottom of the con 
cave- shaped bottom portion of the base 1 02 is suf?ciently less 
than the angle of the curve toWards the top of the base 102. 
Similar ranges may be utiliZed as discussed With respect to 
providing effective Weight distribution for the user. As a 
result, the angles of the curve in the concave shape are helpful 
in both effectively distributing the Weight of the user and 
restricting the tilt of the assembled base 102 and base cover 
106. 

[0043] In an alternative embodiment, the compartment may 
be narroWed so that the compartment does not occupy the 
periphery of the base 102. For example, a space may exist 
betWeen the compartment and the periphery of the inner layer 
of the base 102. This space may be large enough to alloW the 
Weight of the compound in the compartment to be directed 
toWards the portion in the center of the base 102. As a result, 
the user standing in a neutral position on the base cover 106 
may stay in that neutral position. If the user moves in a 
particular direction, the assembled base 102 and base cover 
106 may tilt in that direction, but Will have a restricted range 
of motion based on the Weight of the compound being 
directed toWards the center of the base 102. 

[0044] In yet another alternative embodiment, the compart 
ment is not narroWed, but a variation in the amount of the 
compound is utiliZed for effective Weight distribution and 
restriction of tilt movement. For example, a large amount of 
cement may be utiliZed toWards the center of the base 102, 
e.g., ?lling the base 102 to the top With cement in the center 
and the immediately surrounding area, and a small amount of 
cement may be utiliZed toWards the periphery of the base 102, 
e.g., ?lling the base 102 only halfWay With cement in the area 
around the periphery of the base 102. Alternatively, the com 
partment may be shaped so that it is large toWards the center 
to store more of the compound and is smaller toWards the 
periphery to store less of the compound. 

[0045] In another alternative embodiment, a mixture of 
compounds With varying densities is utiliZed for effective 
Weight distribution and restriction of tilt movement. In other 
Words, a ?rst compound may be utiliZed toWards the center 
Whereas a second compound With a loWer density may be 
utiliZed toWards the periphery of the base 102. 
[0046] While these approaches may be utiliZed indepen 
dently to provide effective Weight distribution and restriction 
of tilt movement, a combination of some or all of these 
approaches may also be utiliZed. For example, the angles may 
be con?gured in conjunction With a narroWer compartment to 
suf?ciently provide effective Weight distribution and restric 
tion of tilt movement. Such a combination may be utiliZed to 
reduce the emphasis on any one of these individual 
approaches. For example, the combination of angles and a 
narroWer compartment may alloW for larger angles and a less 
narroW compartment than if these approaches Were indepen 
dently utiliZed. 
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[0047] In one embodiment, once the tilt is restricted by an 
approach or combination of approaches discussed above, the 
user is in a stationary position at that tilt. For example, if the 
user applies more pressure With his or her right foot than left 
foot, the assembled base 102 and base cover 106 tilt toWards 
the right and remain in that position until the user shifts 
direction again. The user may apply just enough pressure to 
the left to move back to the neutral balanced position or may 
apply more pressure to move all the Way to the left. Altema 
tively, the user in the rightWard tilted position may apply 
pressure to tilt forWard so that the user is in a rightWard 
forWard tilted position or backWard so that the user is in a 
rightWard backWard tilted position. The examples provided 
above are intended only for illustrative purposes as various 
positions may be reached as a result of the tilting motion. For 
example, the user may provide pressure along a forWard 
diagonal rightWard so that the assembled based 102 and base 
cover 106 are tilted forWard and to the right on a diagonal. 

[0048] In another embodiment, once the tilt is restricted by 
an approach or combination of approaches discussed above, 
the dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 automati 
cally tilts back to the neutral balanced position. This may be 
accomplished With a relatively small angle along the con 
cave-shaped bottom portion of the base 102 and/ or the Weight 
of the compound being suf?ciently directed toWards the cen 
ter of the base 102. For example, if the user applies more 
pressure With his or her right foot than left foot, the assembled 
base 102 and base cover 106 tilt toWards the right up until the 
restricted range of motion, and then the assembled base 102 
and base cover 106 automatically move back to and possibly 
through (depending on the amount of pressure) the neutral 
balanced position. The user can then move again in the same 
or a different direction, and the assembled base 102 and base 
cover 106 Will once again automatically move back to or 
through the neutral balanced position. 
[0049] The determination as to Whether the dynamic micro 
phone support apparatus 100 stays in a tilted position or 
automatically moves back to or through the neutral balanced 
position depends on factors such as the angle of the curve 
along the concave-shaped bottom portion of the base 102 and 
the Weight of the compound directed toWards the center of the 
base 102. A larger angle and more evenly distributed Weight 
of the compound throughout the base 102 helps the dynamic 
microphone support apparatus 100 stay in the tilted position 
Whereas a smaller angle and distribution of the Weight of the 
compound toWards the center of the base 102 helps the 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 automatically 
tilt back to the neutral balanced position. 
[0050] The base cover 106 also provides a buffer betWeen 
the user and the compound stored in the compartment. For 
example, the user Would likely feel more comfortable stand 
ing on a smooth durable surface rather than glue, cement, etc. 
The base cover 106 may be made from a metal, plastic, or any 
other material that provides su?icient durability to Withstand 
the load from the Weight of the user. 

[0051] The dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 
also has a rod member 110, Which is operably connected to 
the base cover 106. The rod member 110 has a ?rst end, a 
second end, and a middle portion. As illustrated in FIG. 1A, 
the ?rst end is positioned through an opening 108 in the base 
cover 106. As an example, the compound in the compartment 
of the base 102 may be an adhesive material such as cement 
into Which the ?rst end of the rodmember 110 is inserted prior 
to drying of the cement. After drying of the cement, the rod 
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member is noW effectively connected to the base 102. The rod 
member 110 is immovable With respect to the base such that 
a movement of the rod member 110 Would also lead a move 
ment of the base 102 such as a tilt. The rod member 110 is 
made from a material and is of a thickness such that a user’s 
exertion of pressure on the rod member 1 1 0 does not normally 
cause the rod member 110 to break. Accordingly, the rod 
member 110 can be made from most metals, plastics, or other 
suitable materials. In one embodiment, the base 102 is ?lled 
With the cement, the base cover 106 is operably connected to 
the base 102, and the ?rst end of the rod member 110 is 
inserted into the cement through the opening 108. In another 
embodiment, the base 102 is ?lled With the cement, the ?rst 
end of the rod member 1 1 0 is inserted into the cement, and the 
opening 108 is large enough so that the based cover can be 
placed over the second end of the rod member and slid doWn 
the middle portion to then be operably connected to the base 
102. 

[0052] As discussed above, the base 102 may tilt in 
response to an imbalanced use of pressure by the feet of the 
user. Similarly, the user may keep the pres sure from his or her 
feet balanced, but may exert a force on the rod member 110 
that causes the base 102 to tilt. For example, if the user exerts 
a su?icient rightWard force With his or her hands on the rod 
member 110 to move the rod member 110 rightWard, the base 
102, Which is immovable With respect to the rod member 110, 
has to tilt rightWard. The approaches discussed above regard 
ing the angles and Weight distribution of the compound for 
alloWing a tilted position to be stationary or an automatic 
move back from the tilted position are also applicable With 
respect the tilt being caused by a force exerted by the hands of 
the user on the rod member 110. 

[0053] Further, the tilt may be caused by a combination of 
forces exerted on the rod member 110 and the base cover 106. 
For example, the user may be able to make a faster movement 
rightWard if he or she exerts a force rightWard on the rod 
member 110 in addition to, at the same time, providing more 
pressure With his or her right foot than left foot on the base 
cover 106. 

[0054] Further, the second end of the rod member 110 is 
con?gured to receive a microphone apparatus. The micro 
phone apparatus may include a microphone 114, a micro 
phone receptacle 116 into Which the microphone may be 
placed, and a microphone connector 112 that matingly 
engages With the second end of the rod member 11 0. The term 
matingly engage is intended to include any effective fastening 
methodology. As illustrated in FIG. 1A, the second end of the 
rod member 110 may have threads so that the microphone 
connector 112 may be screWed onto it. HoWever, other fas 
tening methodologies may be utiliZed. 
[0055] Further, FIG. 1B illustrates the dynamic micro 
phone support apparatus 100 that may be utiliZed in conjunc 
tion With a microphone 114 and a microphone receptacle 116 
Without the microphone connector 112 shoWn in FIG. 1A. 
Accordingly, in an alternative embodiment, the receptacle 
116 is directly matingly engaged With the rod member 110. 
The rod member 110 may be made longer for this particular 
embodiment to compensate for the lack of the microphone 
connector 112. HoWever, the rod member 110 in either 
embodiment may include multiple members connected to one 
another and slidable With respect to one another so that the rod 
member 110 is adjustable in height for users having different 
heights. Alternatively, the microphone connector 112 may 
include multiple members connected to one another and slid 
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able With respect to one another to provide the user With the 
convenience of adjusting the microphone height at a higher 
level. 
[0056] In yet another embodiment, the microphone 114 
may be directly connected to the rod member 110. As an 
example, the microphone 114 may have a threaded bottom to 
matingly engage With the rod member 110. The microphone 
114 may then be vertically positioned on the rod member 110. 
The microphone 114 may also have a threaded portion in the 
middle of the microphone 114 to alloW the microphone to be 
horiZontally tWisted onto the rod member 110. 
[0057] Although the threads in FIGS. 1A and 1B are illus 
trated as protruding from the rod member 110, the threads 
may alternatively protrude from the microphone connector 
112, the microphone receptacle 116, or the microphone 114 
depending on Which con?guration is utiliZed. Accordingly, 
the rod member may have a receptacle With inner threads for 
receiving any of these components. These fastening method 
ologies are intended only as examples as a variety of fastening 
methodologies may be utiliZed. 
[0058] FIG. 2 illustrates an assembly 200 of the dynamic 
microphone support apparatus 100 from FIG. 1A connected 
to the microphone connector 112, the microphone receptacle 
116, and the microphone 114. The assembly 200 may be 
positioned on a surface 104 such as a stage for a performance. 
The assembly 200 may be utiliZed by users in homes or other 
areas to perform on their oWn, or even sing along With their 
favorite performers While Watching performance on the tele 
vision or listing to performances on the radio. 
[0059] FIGS. 3A-3C illustrate the assembly shoWn in FIG. 
2 as utiliZed by a performer 302. In particular, FIG. 3A illus 
trates a performer 302 standing on the base cover 106 in a 
neutral balanced position. The performer 302 is applying 
equal pressure With both of her feet onto the base cover 106 
and is not exerting any substantial force on the rod member 
110. 

[0060] FIG. 3B illustrates a leftWard tilt from the perspec 
tive of the performer 302. The leftWard tilt is caused by the 
performer 302 exerting more pressure on her left foot than her 
right foot and/ or the performer 302 exerting a leftWard 
directed force on the rod member 110. As a result, the base 
102 and the base cover 106 tilt to the left, Which causes the 
performer to also tilt to the left. The force may optionally be 
exerted on the microphone connector 112, Which is operably 
connected to the rod member 110. 

[0061] In addition, FIG. 3C illustrates a rightWard tilt from 
the perspective of the performer 302. The rightWard tilt is 
caused by the performer 302 exerting more pressure on her 
right foot than her left foot and/ or the performer 302 exerting 
a rightWard directed force on the rod member 1 1 0. As a result, 
the base 102 and the base cover 106 tilt to the right, Which 
causes the performer to also tilt to the right. 
[0062] As can be seen from FIGS. 3A-3C, the performer 
302 may move during a performance and basically have the 
microphone folloW her movements. As a result, her head does 
not move too much With respect to the microphone 114 and 
alloWs for consistency in the quality of the audio outputted 
from the microphone 114. Further, the safety concerns of 
stationary microphone stands during a dance performance are 
alleviated as the dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 
folloWs the performer 302. 
[0063] FIGS. 4A-4D illustrate various con?gurations for 
operably connecting the rod member 110 to the base cover 
106. FIG. 4A illustrates an internal vieW of the assembly 200 
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shown in FIG. 2. The opening 108 allows the rod member 110 
to extend directly doWn into the compartment of the base 102. 
As the compartment in this embodiment contains cement, the 
rod member only needs to be inserted a su?icient amount into 
the cement to solidify the connection rather than to the bottom 
of the base 102. For example, the rod member 110 may be 
inserted halfWay into the compartment of the base 102. The 
rod member 110 may be inserted all the Way to the bottom in 
this embodiment, but it is not necessary. 
[0064] FIG. 4B illustrates an internal vieW of an alternative 
embodiment of the assembly 200 shoWn in FIG. 2. In this 
embodiment, the compound may be an adhesive or a non 
adhesive material. For example, sand may be utiliZed. The rod 
member 110 extends through the opening 108 in an outer 
layer 402 of the base cover 106 and stops at an inner layer 404 
of the base cover 106. The hole created by the opening 108 
may have threads to alloW the rod member 110 to be matingly 
engaged to the base cover 106. HoWever, other fastening 
methodologies, e. g., utiliZing glue, may operably connect the 
rod member 110 to the base cover 106. 

[0065] FIG. 4C illustrates an internal vieW of an alternative 
embodiment of the assembly 200 shoWn in FIG. 2. In this 
embodiment, the compound may be an adhesive or a non 
adhesive material. For example, sand may be utiliZed. The rod 
member 110 extends through the opening 108 in the outer 
layer 402 of the base cover 106 through the inner layer 404 of 
the base cover 106 into the compartment. The rod member 
110 then extends into the compartment doWn through an 
opening in an inner layer 406 of the concave-shaped bottom 
portion doWn to an outer layer 408 of the concave-shaped 
bottom portion. The hole created by the opening in the inner 
layer 406 of the concave-shaped bottom portion may have 
threads to alloW the rod member 1 1 0 to be operably connected 
to the base cover 106 by being matingly engaged to the 
concave-shaped bottom portion. HoWever, other fastening 
methodologies, e. g., utiliZing glue, may operably connect the 
rod member 110 to the opening created by the inner layer 406 
of the concave-shaped bottom portion. 
[0066] FIG. 4D illustrates an internal vieW of an alternative 
embodiment of the assembly 200 shoWn in FIG. 4C. In this 
embodiment, the compound may be a ?uid such as Water. 
[0067] FIGS. 5A-5D illustrate various con?gurations for 
operably connecting the base cover 106 to the base 102. In 
particular, FIG. 5A illustrates the base cover 106 having a 
doWnWardly extending recessed portion 502, Which may be 
threaded. The threads may matingly engage With internal 
threads located Within the upWard periphery of the base 102. 
In this con?guration, a user can take hold of the outer portion 
of the base cover 106 to tWist the base cover 106 on or off. 

[0068] FIG. 5B illustrates the base cover 106 having a 
doWnWardly extending portion 504, Which may be threaded. 
The threads may matingly engage With internal threads 
located Within the upWard periphery of the base 102. In this 
con?guration, a user can take hold of the opening of the base 
cover 106 With his or her thumb or ?ngers to tWist the base 
cover 106 on or off. 

[0069] FIG. 5C illustrates the base cover 106 having a 
plurality of holes and the base 102 having an inner Wall 
portion 506 With corresponding holes.A plurality of fasteners 
508, such as screWs, may then be inserted through the holes in 
the base cover 106 and the holes in the inner Wall portion 506 
to operably connect the base cover 106 to the base 102. The 
fasteners 508 are not limited to screWs. For example, the 
fasteners 508 may also be bolts or the like. 
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[0070] FIG. 5D illustrates the base cover 106 having a 
plurality of holes and the top of the base 102 having corre 
sponding holes. A plurality of fasteners 508, such as screWs, 
may then be inserted through the holes in the based cover and 
the holes in the inner Wall portion 506 to operably connect the 
base cover 106 to the base 102. 

[0071] In another alternative embodiment, the top portion 
of the base cover 106 may have a ?ap that extends over the 
base 102. The ?ap may matingly engage the top portion of the 
base 102. The user may then simply pull the base cover 106 
off of the base 102 and put it right back on by pressing doWn 
on the base cover 106 With respect to the base 102. 

[0072] FIGS. 6A and 6B illustrate alternative con?gura 
tions for ?lling and removing the compound from the com 
partment in the base 102. In particular, FIG. 6A illustrates an 
opening 602 in the base cover 106 in Which the compound 
may be placed Within the compartment or removed from the 
compartment of the base 102. For example, a ?uid such as 
Water may be poured into the compartment through the open 
ing 602 or removed from the compartment through the open 
ing 602. Further, a cap 604 may be utiliZed to cover the 
opening 602 to keep the ?uid in the compartment of the base 
102. The opening 602 and cap 604 con?guration is particu 
larly helpful in that a user does not have to remove the base 
cover 106 from the base 102 to ?ll the base 102 With ?uid. 
Further, in one embodiment the base cover 106 is integrally 
connected to the base 102 such that the base cover 106 and the 
base 102 are a single piece. In such a con?guration, the base 
cover 106 cannot be removed from the base 102, and the 
opening 602 and cap 604 con?guration alloWs the user to ?ll, 
empty, and/ or re?ll the base 1 02 With ?uid or other compound 
such as sand. 

[0073] The user’s ability to empty the base 102 may be 
particularly useful for moving the dynamic microphone sup 
port apparatus 100. For instance, the user may Want to travel 
With the dynamic microphone support apparatus 100. 
Accordingly, the user can empty compound, e.g., Water, from 
the base 102 by removing the cap 604 and pouring the Water 
out from the opening 602. Upon arriving at the intended 
destination, the user can then remove the cap 604, re?ll the 
base 102 With Water, and place the cap 604 over the opening 
602. As a result, the user can travel much more conveniently 
With a lighter dynamic microphone support apparatus 100. 
[0074] FIG. 6B illustrates an opening 606 in the base 102 in 
Which the compound may be placed Within the compartment 
or removed from the compartment of the base 102. A cap 608 
may be utiliZed to cover the opening 606. This opening 606 
and cap 608 con?guration operates similarly to the opening 
602 and cap 604 con?guration of FIG. 6A except that this 
particular con?guration is along the side of the base 102. In an 
alternative embodiment, the opening 606 and cap 608 con 
?guration may be positioned on the bottom of the base 102 to 
conceal the cap 608 from vieW. 

[0075] In an alternative embodiment, the principles dis 
cussed above may be utiliZed With a base cover 106 that 
extends substantially outside of the periphery of the base 102. 
The base cover 106 may still be matingly engaged to the base 
102 as discussed above, e.g., holes in the area of the base 
cover 106 directly above the holes in the base 102 so that 
screWs may be inserted. The base cover 106 may extend 
suf?ciently beyond the periphery of the base 102 to restrict 
the tilt of the base 102. The longer the extension of the base 
cover 106, the more restricted the tilt Will be as the base cover 
106 Will contact the ground sooner and restrict movement. In 
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an embodiment that provides for automatic movement back 
from the tilted position, springs may be positioned on the 
bottom of the extending base cover 106 to automatically push 
the base cover 106, and thereby the base 102 operably con 
nected to the base cover 106, back from the tilt. In this 
embodiment, less emphasis on factors such as the angles 
and/ or Weight distribution of the compound are necessary. 
[0076] It is understood that apparatus described herein may 
also be applied in other types of contexts. In other Words, the 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 is not intended to 
be limited to use With a microphone 114. For example, the 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 may be utiliZed 
With an umbrella. A user may take the dynamic microphone 
support apparatus 100 to the beach and connect anumbrella to 
provide shade. UtiliZing one of the con?gurations in FIGS. 
6A and 6B, the user may even ?ll the dynamic microphone 
support apparatus 100 With Water or sand once arriving at the 
beach so that carrying the dynamic microphone support appa 
ratus 100 to the beach may be accomplished With relative 
ease. The dynamic microphone support apparatus 100 may 
provide the user With the ability to make small adjustments to 
the umbrella to provide shade for varying angles of sunlight. 
Various other components may also be connected to the 
dynamic microphone support apparatus 100. Those skilled in 
the art Will appreciate that the various adaptations and modi 
?cations of the embodiments of this apparatus may be con 
?gured Without departing from the scope and spirit of the 
present apparatus. Therefore, it is to be understood that, 
Within the scope of the appended claims, the present appara 
tus may be practiced other than as speci?cally described 
herein. 

1 claim: 
1. An apparatus comprising: 
a base having a concave-shaped bottom portion that is 

positional on a surface; 
a compartment in the base that stores an adhesive material; 
a base cover that is positioned over the base and covers the 

compartment such that Weight of a user positioned on 
the base cover applied in a direction causes the base to 
tilt With respect to the surface in the direction; and 

a rod member having a ?rst end, a second end, and a middle 
portion, the ?rst end being positioned through an open 
ing in the base cover into the adhesive material in the 
compartment such that the rod member is immovable 
With respect to the base, the second end con?gured to 
receive a microphone apparatus, and the middle portion 
con?gured to connect the ?rst end and the second end. 

2. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the adhesive material 
is cement. 

3. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the adhesive material 
is glue. 

5. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the base cover is 
metal. 

6. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the base cover is 
plastic. 

7. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the microphone appa 
ratus includes a microphone and a microphone connector, the 
microphone connector having a receptacle for the micro 
phone and being con?gured to matingly engage With the 
second end. 

8. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the microphone appa 
ratus includes a microphone that matingly engages With the 
second end. 
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9. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the ?rst end extends 
doWnWard into the base and matingly engages an inner layer 
of the concave-shaped bottom portion. 

10. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the base cover mat 
ingly engages the base such that the base cover is immovable 
With respect to the base. 

11. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein the base and the base 
cover are integrally formed from a same material. 

12. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein an angle of curvature 
of the concave-shaped bottom portion of the base restricts the 
tilting of the base. 

13. The apparatus of claim 12, Wherein the angle of curva 
ture of the concave-shaped bottom portion of the base causes 
the base to automatically move back to an original position of 
the base after the tilting of the base. 

14. The apparatus of claim 1, Wherein a Weight distribution 
of the adhesive material directed toWards the center of the 
base restricts the tilting of the base. 

15. The apparatus of claim 14, Wherein the Weight distri 
bution of the adhesive material directed toWards the center of 
the base causes the base to automatically move back to an 
original position of the base after the tilting of the base. 

16. An apparatus comprising: 
a base having a concave-shaped bottom portion that is 

positional on a surface; 
a compartment in the base that stores an adhesive material; 
a base cover that is positioned over the base and covers the 

compartment such that Weight of a user positioned on 
the base cover applied in a direction causes the base to 
tilt With respect to the surface in the direction; and 

a rod member having a ?rst end, a second end, and a middle 
portion, the ?rst end being positioned through an open 
ing in the base cover into the adhesive material in the 
compartment such that the rod member is immovable 
With respect to the base, the second end con?gured to 
receive a microphone apparatus, and the middle portion 
con?gured to connect the ?rst end and the second end 
such that a force applied to the rod member in a direction 
by a user positioned on the base cover causes the base to 
tilt With respect to the surface in the direction. 

17. The apparatus of claim 16, Wherein an angle of curva 
ture of the concave-shaped bottom portion of the base 
restricts the tilting of the base. 

18. The apparatus of claim 17, Wherein the angle of curva 
ture of the concave-shaped bottom portion of the base causes 
the base to automatically move back to an original position of 
the base after the tilting of the base. 

19. The apparatus of claim 16, Wherein a Weight distribu 
tion of the adhesive material directed toWards the center of the 
base restricts the tilting of the base. 

20. The apparatus of claim 19, Wherein the Weight distri 
bution of the adhesive material directed toWards the center of 
the base causes the base to automatically move back to an 
original position of the base after the tilting of the base. 

21. An apparatus comprising: 
a base having a concave-shaped bottom portion that is 

positional on a surface; 
a compartment in the base that stores a compound to sta 

biliZe the Weight of a user; 
a base cover that is positioned over the base; and 
a rod member having a ?rst end, a second end, and a middle 

portion, the ?rst end being connected to the base cover 
such that the rod member is immovable With respect to 
the base, the second end con?gured to receive a micro 




